To: Lesley Groffllesley. jee@amail.com]
From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Mon 7/14/2014 2:24:31 PM
Subject: Re: Car for Mariana

One month and get me a cost

On Monday, July 14, 2014, Lesley Groff <lesley jee@ gmail.com™ wrote:
How long shall | prepay for the Audi A6 for Mariana? July 18-Aug. 7 good dates?

On Jul 14, 2014, at 7:39 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail. com> wrote:

orgoanize a car in warsaw again for marian audi 6, friday . want to tlak to

slayton today, zagat.
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