To: jeffrey E.[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Wed 7/2/2014 6:03:23 PM
Subject: Larry Delson

not sure if you had same idea about Larry billing Leon or we continue to pay as we
did last month from FT Real Estate
note larry also adjusted his billing period from june 1 - june 30 for his fee of
25,000

please advise

thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: lawrence delson
Date: June 25, 2014 at 10:52:56 AM EDT

To: ?
Reply-To: lawrence delson

Hi Rich
| hope you had a nice weekend.

As the month is drawing to a close, when convenient, let me know which
entity | should bill.

Also, | had previously billed you for the period 4/23 - 5/23. Since there
were a few days at the very end of May that | was out of town, |
will for this month bill you 6/1 - 6/30.

Also, let me know when you want to go over the plane expenses with Rich
J.

Larry
Delson International, Inc.
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