To: jeffrey E.[ieevacation@gmail.com]
From: Cecile de Jongh

Sent: Mon 6/30/2014 4:33:18 PM
Subject: Re:

| got confirmed the pricing ($72,214) and sent it to Rich with contact name

and number.

With warm regards,
Cecile

On Monday, June 30, 2014 12:31 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com=> wrote:

denali?

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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JEE
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