
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
From: jeffrey E. 
Sent Wed 6/4/2014 3:08:49 PM 
Subject: Re: checking in 

I 

yes 

On Wed, Jun 4, 2014 at 9:08 AM, Eileen Alexanderson < > wrote: 

Distribution from Black Family Partners and Annuity payments to Leon were made yesterday. 

Mean for APO stock for the day was $24.89. Just checking in-should we proceed with APO 1 
GRAT No 4 today? 

Rich and I met with Jeffery H again yesterday, please call when you have time for an update. 
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