
To: Jeffrey EMeevacation©gmail.comj 
From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Sent Wed 6/4/2014 3:16:00 PM 
Subject: RE: checking in 

Will do. 

Also, just an update- JPM POA was notarized this morn but I just spoke to Marc Miller from Paul 
Barrett's office and he told me Leon needs to sign most of these dots even with me having the POA. He 
will walk me thru them today, I will summarize for Leon and tee up for his signature when he returns. 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeeyacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, June 04, 2014 11:09 AM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: Re: checking in 

yes 

On Wed, Jun 4, 2014 at 9:08 AM, Eileen Alexanderson wrote: 

Distribution from Black Family Partners and Annuity payments to Leon were made yesterday. 

Mean for APO stock for the day was $24.89. Just checking in-should we proceed with APO I 
GRAT No 4 today? 

Rich and I met with Jeffery H again yesterday, please call when you have time for an update. 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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