To: jeffrey E.[ieevacation@gmail.com]
From: John Christensen

Sent: Fri 6/20/2014 5:47:00 PM

Subject: Re: Irrigation consultant/installer

Meeting with Ritz Carlton head landscaper tomorrow. Will keep you updated.

On Jun 20, 2014, at 1:43 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

yes,  what about landscape . designer

On Fri, Jun 20, 2014 at 1:41 PM, John Christensen _wrmc:

Jeffrey,

We are using an outside consultant to plan our irrigation system on LSJ. | need him & full
days to do the master plan, lead the install and get things optimized. He 1s very
hands on and is getting things done.

His rate is $22 per hour, This 1s what he is paid at Frenchman's Reef where he is in charge
of irrigation.

Is that OK with you?
Thanks
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please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
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