
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Richard D'Agliilla Jeffrey Eljeevacation©gmail.corn] 
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent Wed 6/18/2014 8:47:58 PM 
Subject: Re: AP SHL Investors 

thanks 
I suspect the sale document or notification thereof was not communicated to the Apollo tax 
preparer. We will get this done so that you do not get a 2013 K-1. 

On Wed, Jun IS, 2014 at 3:42 PM, Richard Kahn alla> wrote: 

We did receive a K-1 after the FTC 2012 tax return was filed. They historically have sent us our K-1 
every year after or on 9/15. We reported the sale and wrote off the balance to long-term capital 
gain. 

Attached is the K-1 which shows that they did not zero out the balance. 

Please call me with any questions. 

Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cc 
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