
To: LvJr 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent: Fri 6/20/2014 7:19:41 PM 
Subject: Re: 8727 Engines completed 

ok 

On Fri, Jun 20, 2014 at 3:15 PM, Lvjct atra> wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Boeing engines are completed, will ship to Brunswick as soon as payment is 
received,. 

please find attached final invoices for Boeing 727 engine inspections,. 
#1 engine total $367,925.48 we owe final payment of $185,195.01 
#3 engine total $355,843.42 we owe final payment of $177,987.32 

total owed $363,182.33 

Do you approve to send wire? 

thank you, 
Larry 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
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