To: jeffrey E.[ieevacation@gmail.com]
From: Philippe Laznowski

Sent: Woed 7/2/2014 1:19:34 PM
Subject: Re: Master Bedroom

Great
Thank you

Can 1 place the order for all the equipment,
Can you please send me the signed estimate and how do you want to manage the deposit
thank you

Philippe

Le 2 juil. 2014 3 15:17, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> a écrit :

Ok

On Wednesday, July 2, 2014, Philippe Laznowski_ wrote:

Dear Jeffrey,
Please find attached the estimate to update the master bedroom (tv+crestron)

If you give me your agreement we will do it as soon as the TV is available (should be in the coming days)
just to let you know we are on site today to install a temporary solution to control the shades

| am waiting for your feedback

Thank you

Philippe

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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