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From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Fri 5/30/2014 2:48.06 PM
Subject: Re: Amfar Charity Event?

get me three tickets

On Fri, May 30, 2014 at 10:46 AM, Lesley Groff <lesley jeef@gmail.com™> wrote:

Please let me know if I need to do anything for you re the Amfar Charity event on June 10th
in NY

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: RE:
Date: May 29, 2014 4:40:05 PM EDT

To: JEﬂrei Eistein < EEVECEHGH@GWEH.GDW}_

Amfar is a charity event.

| got two tickets and | can get one for you.

If you are planning to have few people (girls, plus Eva plus Peter etc) you might want to
buy a table.

Please let me know if you decide to do so - as | can probable get a cheaper table (some
table are very expensive).

Date: Thu, 29 May 2014 15:41:27 -0400
Subject:
From: jeevacation@gmail.com

e

do i need to buy tickets for amfar?

please note
The information contained in this communication is
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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