
To: Joscha Bach 
From: jeffrey E. 
Sent Wed 5/28/2014 7:36:35 PM 
Subject: Re: Funding for WS 

rich kahn 

Richard Kahn 

On Wed, May 28, 2014 at 3:26 PM, Joscha Bach •:= > wrote: 

Dear Jeffrey, 

how are you doing? There is a book I would like to send your way; are you currently in NYC? 

The programmers will arrive on Sunday and Monday. My bank account is rapidly emptying, and 
I will need to feed and house them. The B&B can send a bill directly to any address we give 
them, and they have taken care of their tickets (in the hope of being reimbursed). 

is there an assistant that I should contact about the details of the workshop funding? I should 
probably have done this earlier. 

Bests and thank you, 

Joscha 
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