
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Tue 6/17/2014 12:18:49 PM 
Subject Re: Columbia Student Services Online - Log in 

it looks like they will send her the 35k until it is needed „ now looks like sept 

On Tue, Jun 17, 2014 at 8:06 AM, Richard Kahn 

i paid 35,000 on your account on 6/12 per jee request 
please verify funds hit your account as i see they left jee bank account 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel
fa 
cel 

wrote: 

On Jun 17, 2014, at 8:04 AM wrote: 

> Hi Rich, 
> My school bill is now available and is due till July I 0th. Could you please pay the balance. 

Below is the link to the website. 
> https://ssol.columbia.cdu/ 
> My user I 
> Password 

> I 

> Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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