ro:  waianal

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Fri 6/20/2014 10:10:12 AM
Subject: Re:

I paid for car . on my credit card’ did you give them the reservation number

On Fri, Jun 20, 2014 at 4:09 AM, Mariana _ wrote:

Regarding tape skandal article that vou showed me the other day its actually very big thing

which may result government cancellation...

Sent from my 1Phone
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