From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Fri 6/20/2014 10:30:45 AM
Subject: Re:

[ will fix it ,

On Fri, Jun 20, 2014 at 3:35 AM, Mariana _ wrote:

Thanks again for yesterday :) 1 just leanded :)

Regarding car unfortunatelly they said that they cant rent me a car because 1 use debit not credit

card. Looks like another time... Thank you anyway :)

Speak soon
Hugs

Sent from my iPhone
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