To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail. com)
From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Fri 5/16/2014 8:06:59 PM

subject: Fwd: ||| I

OK to give CC to Dr. Fallahpour to pay the balance of $1000

Begin forwarded message:

From:

Subject: re:Maria

Date: May 16, 2014 3:51:17 PM EDT
To: lesley.jee@agmail.com

oo Affevnoon!

| was emaling you bo ged o contact pumber S0 | can spesk with you m..- We are finaiizing Me repart and wi have it by Monday bot there /s @ balance: of
F1.008 00 i pour codatd st call md willl @ G0 Ao thal wauld e griar

Thank Yoo

Harteyann Diaz-MacKenzie

Brain Resource Center

263 West End Ave Suite #1D
New York, NY 10023
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