
To: Jeffrey Ejjeevacation maitcom 
Cc: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Fri 5 -14:55 PM 
Subject Re 

Hello Dr. Fallahpour...Bella in our accounting dept will call and give you a CC #. 
I will circle back to you on Monday re the documents! 

Thanks and have a great weekend. 

Lesley 

On May 16, 2014, at 4:11 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacationOgmail.com> wrote: 

yes 

On Fri, May 16, 2014 at 4:06 PM, Lesley Groff 

OK to give CC to Dr. Fallahpour to pay the balance of $1000 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: re 
Date: May 16, 2014 3:51:17 PM EDT 
To: 

Godo Afternoon! 

> wrote: 

I was 'mailing you to get a contact number so f can speak with you abotat ... We are finalizing the report and me 

have it by Monday but there is a balance of $1000.00 if you could just call me with a cc number that 

would be great. 

Thank You 

Harleyann Din-MacKenzie 

Brain Resource Center 
263 West End Ave Suite #1D 
New York. NY 10023 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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