
To: jeffrey EMemmeation©gmail.com] 
From: Amy Cassell 
Sent Mon 7/7/2014 7:45:10 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Sure! Let me know when it's convenient. 

My best, 
Amy 

On Mon, Jul 7, 2014 at 2:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

tomorw? 

On Mon, Jul 7, 2014 at 3:24 PM, Amy Cassell wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I hope you had a nice holiday. Confirming you received the attached spreadsheet outlining all of 
the hours. Please let me know when it's convenient for you to discuss the next steps. 

Many thanks, 
Amy 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: Amy Cassell 
Date: Thu, Jun 26, 2014 at 4:23 PM 
Subject: Re: 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationciumail corn> 

Jeffrey, 

Here's a spreadsheet outlining the time and dollars. Please feel free to call me anytime tomorrow 
to discuss or over the weekend when convenient for you. 

Many thanks, 
Amy 

On Thu, Jun 26, 2014 at 12:14 PM, Amy Cassell wrote: 

The two designers are full time (one at $125/hour, the other S 1 00/hour), the project admin is 
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approx 10/week, I am approx 3 days per week. On average for 5 months (Aug-Dec) it's just 
over $65k/month, my proposal is rounded down to the fixed fee of $65k. For the first 
month were working but not at full time, thus $30K. 

I can give you further breakdown. Let me know. 

Amy 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 26, 2014, at 12:03 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

yes , but that is what doesn't make sense, . 100 perhour for assistnat meets 
200k per year. each. . and htat is full time . yours at 245 . means full time as 
well 

On Thu, Jun 26, 2014 at 1:01 PM, Amy Cassell wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

Confirming you received my contract with hourly rates? Can we speak later today or 
anytime tomorrow? Let me know when/number. 

Thanks, 
Amy 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 26, 2014, at 10:58 AM, "Jeffrey E." leevacation@gmail,com> wrote: 

waiting for explanation 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@smail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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