
To: Richard Joslin 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Tue 5/13/2014 10:34:35 AM 
Subject Re: 

Any for past years 

On Tuesday, May 13, 2014, Richard Joslit wrote: 

Apollo agreed that payment should have been to BFP. I have call with Apollo at 10am with 
person responsible for calculation and payment. Will find out about timing of JH payment 

On May 12, 2014, at 10:52 PM, "Jeffrey E." leevacationAgmail.com> wrote: 

Please get an answer on heritage payments. 
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