
To: bellaklein 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Fri 4/25/2014 2:32:45 PM 
Subject: Re: 

yes 

On Fri, Apr 25, 2014 at 10:31 AM, bellaklein .: > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
The due date for tuition balance to the is 
6/13/2014 in the amount of $4,950. It can be pat trect y to t to sc too 
immediately, 

need $3900 for the hotel and $1500 for food and supplies expenses 
for the 6 weeks in Paris. Please confirm I should wire $5400 to her personal 
account today. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

The housing info for 6 weeks in Paris is below: 

The cost will be $3,900 and does not include food. 

We suggest students bring $250 per week you are stain with us for food etc... 

The invoice for attached. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: April 16. 2 • • 
To: Bella Klein 

Hi, Bella. 
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Don't you know the approximate date, when the payment check of studies 
and housing could come to my hands, so I could attach it to apply for 
a visa. 

I've done everything else needed besides it since got your money transfer a week 
ago. 

thank you. 

avec win, 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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