
To: Lesley Groff 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Tue 014 12:16:19 AM 
Subject Re: 

call him , password doesnot work 

On Mon, May 19, 2014 at 3:53 PM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

do you wish to speak with Dr. Fallahpour? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kamran Fallah our, PhD" 
Subject: Re: 
Date: May 19, 2014 3 39 34 PM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff < 

Hi Lesley. 
Please see attached full report. 
The password is her year of birth (for confidentiality). 

I suggest that we speak by phone to discuss a few details. 

On 5/19/14 11:21 AM, "Lesley Groff' wrote: 

I think email will be fine for now... 

thanks so very much. 

On May 19, 2014, at 11:20 AM, Kamran Fallahpour, PhD wrote: 
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We can email it. 

We can also send regular mail if needed. 

Let us know what address in that case. 

On 5/19/14 11:18 AM, "Lesley Groff' 
wrote: 

Tremendous! I assume you will be emailing 
the report to me? 

Lesley 

On May 19, 2014, at 11:15 AM, Kamran 
Fallahpour, PhD wrote: 

Hi. 

Just wanted to let you know 
that we will be sending the 
report later 

today 

or tomorrow morning latest. 

We can also speak by phone to 
discuss next steps if any. 
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Best, 

KF 

On 5/16/14 3:09 PM "Lesle 
Groff' 
wrote: 

Hello Dr 
Fallahpour. Just 
checking in. How 
goes the paper 
work and 

documents? 

Lesley 

Sent from my 
iPhone 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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