
To: Richard Joslin j 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 5/13/2014 8:15:19 PM 
Subject: Re: avionetta 

they can 

On Tue, May 13, 2014 at 4:13 PM, Richard Joslin < > wrote: 

I think it was for the refurbishing 

$109K paid in total 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation @g mai I.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, May 13, 2014 3:44 PM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Subject: Re: avionetta 

who is rance paying use tax to? and why? 

On Tue, May 13, 2014 at 3:41 PM, Richard Joslin wrote: 

This Trust (TVPEAT 624) dates to Feb 2012 — we bought plane in Aug 2011 

Richard Joslin 

CFO 

Elysium Management LLC 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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