To:  Greg Wyler

From: jeffrey E.
Sent; Fri 6/6/2014 1:16:03 AM

Subject: Re: Please

you are asking for hundreds of milllions of real dollars.  just look at salary plus bonus plus
frindge in 15, goofy, irresposible, and careless.  how can anyone trust that their money is well
protected if your accountant can't add.

On Thu, Jun 5, 2014 at 6:40 PM, Greg Wyler < EGE_- ot

It was done quickly, but I do think the numbers add up. There needs some verbal explanation
with it. On Jun 5, 2014 5:36 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

i would never , mainly because it is not well done and the numbers don't

even add, so no one with half a brain looked at it

On Thu, Jun 5, 2014 at 6:32 PM, Greg Wyler _ wrote:

> Do not share the file I sent you. For your eyes only....
-

> Lots of goodness happening.
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