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From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Tue 5/27/2014 6:55:23 PM
Subject: Re: Boeing paint

ok

On Tue, May 27, 2014 at 2:21 PM, Lvijet - wrote:

Jeffrey,
The Boeing is sanded and ready for prime,.

Should | send contact john Ashley and advise him the price is going up< and is now
a minimum of $3.2M and we are painting the aircraft, if he wants to send a Non

refundable deposit of $200k to cover the paint, he can have input on color?

is this a good idea?
just a thought?

thx
Larry
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