To Richard Koo

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 4/17/2014 6:20:01 PM
Subject: Re: Revized Proposal Karyna

ok

On Thu, Apr 17, 2014 at 2:17 PM, Richard Kahn _wmtt:

attached 1s final quote of approved items for Karyna apartment in the amount of 48,679 32

please note the following:
a) 20% design fee

b) additional markup of some items 10% per Lindscy
¢) purchase of some items at retail with no discount per Lindsey
d) additional delivery charges on a few items will be added to quote

open items still be be addressed are as follows:

Entry - small console / mirror
Dining Room - small table & chairs

Living Room - curtains / desk chair / piece for storage / lamps
Master - curtain / carpet (sacco 11k credit) / bedside tables / dresser / lounge chair

please advise if ok to wire funds

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
MNew York, New York 10022

Bank Information:
Bank Wells Fargo

Rouine

Account name:
Lindsey Coral Harper Interior Design

Items left for Karyna's Apartment:
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Entry
Small console
Mirror

Dining
Small table and chairs

LR

Curtains

Desk Chair
Piece for storage
Lamps

MBR

Curtains

Carpet- with JE Credit from Sacco Carpet
Bedside tables

Dresser

Lounge chair

Best,
Lindsey

134 East 64th Street, 1B
New York, NY 10065

Begin forwarded message:

From: <
Subject: Fwd: Revised Proposal Karyna
Date: April 16, 2014 8:16:44 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn <

Rich here is the final invoice of everything that has been approved for karynas apartment,

Sent from my iPhone
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Erin Cunningham |

To:
Subject: FW: Revised Proposal Karyna

Date: .-"'Lirjl 16, 20014 at 7:12:18 PM EDT

Hi! I hope you are well. Great to see you on the street the other day.
Here is a final invoice of everything approved.

Many Thanks!

Please send payment to Lindsey. :)

From:
Subject: Revised Proposal Karyna

Date: Wed, 16 Apr 2014 18:42:37 -0400
[‘{":*

To: I

134 East 64th Street, 1B
MNew York, NY 10065

please note

The mformation contained in this communication 18
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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