To: jeffrey E.[jeevacation@gmail.com]

From: lawrence delson
Sent: Thur 5/22/2014 1:24:00 PM
Subject: Re:

MNoted. Let me discuss with Rich if there are other revisions he would like
from Tom.

Larry Delson

Delson International, Inc.
P.O. BOX 3776

New York, NY 10163

(T)

(F) 646-810-0217

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com=
To: lawrence delson

Sent: Thursday, May 22, 2014 9:20 AM
Subject: Re:

noe

On Thu, May 22, 2014 at 9:17 AM, lawrence delson _wmtc;

Have you seen the draft 1040x yet?

I had some comments on the presentation which Rich and I have
discussed.

Larry Delson
Delson International, Inc.
P.0. BOX 3776

New York, NY 10163

(T)
(F) 646-810-0217

From: jeffrey E. <jeev:
To: lawrence delson

Richard Joslin

14 6:34 AM

Subject:
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plane invoice and 12 draft amendment
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