To: Jefirey Epsteinfjeevacation@gmail.com)
From: Richard Joslin

Sent: Thur 4/724/2014 1:32:55 PM

Subject: Fwd: Invoice for Calder

Fyi. Process is slow changing behaviour.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Melanie Spinella

Date: April 23, 2014 at 12:31:4 |I!l ! !I

To: 'Richard Joslin' "Chandler, Pegey NG
Ce: accounting < art = . "Eileen Alexanderson”
. Richard D'Agostino

Subject: RE: Invoice for Calder

| already paid it by wire

From: Richard Joslin
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 12:31 PM
To: Melanie Spinella; Chandler, Pegay
Cc: accounting; art; Eileen Alexanderson; Richard D'Agostino
Subject: FW: Invoice for Calder

Melanie
As part of the payment transition, the Family office will pay jewelry invoices.

Peggy:
Please make sure to send jewelry invoices after approved for payment to
- D - d we will pay invoice and let you know

when paid. Also, please let us know the date jewelry is in our possession.

Thanks

From: Eileen Alexanderson
Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 6:46 AM
To: Richard Joslin; accounting
Cc: Richard D'Agostino
Subject: Fwd: Invoice for Calder
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Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Chandler, Pugg}-‘"_

Date: April 22, 2014 at 4:26:28 PM EDT
To: Melanie Spinclla | G
Ce: "Eileen Alexanders

Subject: FW: Invoice for Calder

Debra has approved for payment

From: Chandler, Peggy
Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2014 2:26 PM
To: Debra Black
Subject: FW: Invoice for Calder

Do you want this paid???

From: Dovid iemen |
Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2014 1:04 P
To: Debra Black

Subject: Invoice for Calder

Dear Debra,

[ hope you're well. I'm writing to follow up on the attached mvoice
for a work by Calder. We are looking to close our accounting with
the Calder Foundation and as such would appreciate an update on
payment.

Thank you,

Dawvid

David Fierman
Salon 94

12 E. 94th St
NY, NY 10128
646 672 9212
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential
and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they are
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged
material. Any review, retransmission, disseminaticn or

other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upcn this
information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited. If you have receiwved this email in
error please contact the sender and delete the material from
any computer.

Apollo Global Management, LLC
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