
To: Jeffrey Epsteinljeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thur 4/24/2014 2:12:07 PM 
Subject: Leon 10mm 

should i send reminder to eileen today for april 25th date she mentioned below? 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: RE: 
Date: April 16, 2014 3:39:11 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Just spoke to Leon. For reasons Jeffrey is aware of the payment will be 
made April 25 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2014 2:01 PM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: Re: 

ok 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 

cell 

On Apr 16, 2014, at 1:48 PM, Eileen Alexanderson 
wrote: 
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I had not been informed that this payment was due on April 
15". Checking with Leon, will be back. 

From: Richard Kah 
Sent: Wednesday, April 16, 2014 1:17 P 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: 

good afternoon 
i hope you survived your april 15th deadlines ok.. 
i left you a voicemail earlier as i am not sure if you spoke 
with jeffrey regarding a 10,000,000 payment that was due 
yesterday 
i checked jeffreys accounts and did not see any wires hit 

can you please call me to discuss 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 
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