
To: Jeffrey E.fleevacationegmail.comj 
From: G Sera 
Sent Sun 5/4/2014 6:32:56 PM 
Subject: Re: Included point 1.9 as per Mr.E request 

2 to 3 years with interests 

On Sunday, May 4, 2014, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

and how long do you think it will take to repay the 700? 

On Sun, May 4, 2014 at 8:21 PM, G Sera •c > wrote: 

We can proceed as you prefer. In case you want us to sign MOU without you signing, we can 
anytime, otherwise we can proceed as you think is best. 
The 700 is the first year of french agency. For the moment we are ready to deploy only that 
money. And of course as per the rules set up you will have to approve the other investments 
for the future years and for the london agency. 

Please let me know if there is anything else we can provide, we are available when you want. 

Thank you 
GS 

On Sunday, May 4, 2014, jeffrey E. <jecvacation@smail.com> wrote: 

thanks. I we never sign motes/ no reason to . 2 . I see the use of the first 700k, but 
nothing after. 3/ 

On Sun, May 4, 2014 at 7:07 PM, wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: G Sera 
Date: May 4, 2014 at 3:06:04 PM GMT+2 
To 

Subject: Included point 1.9 as per Mr.E request 

Thank you 
GS 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation©gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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