To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Fri 3/28/2014 11:56:24 PM

Subject: Fwd: Invoice timing for Jeffrey Epstein?

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joseph Thakuria
Date: March 28, 2014, 7:14:37 PM EDT
To: Lesley Groft
Ce: Rich Kahn <
Subject: Re: Invoice timing for Jeffrey Epstein?

o

Hi Lesley and Rich,

Sorry for only getting to this now. The irb will be meeting on getting this ypo
protocol under mgh on april 1st (this coming tues). So, 1 should have an update on
where we stand on this a few days after that.

I might be overly optimistic, but if all goes well, my hope would be for data by end
of April.

Have a nice weekend,
Joe Thakuna

Hello Joe. Just checking in to see where you stand with an invoice for Jeffrey. My
calendar shows it has been 2 weeks since | last checked in. Please give an update.
Thanks, Lesley

Sent from my 1Phone

On Mar 10, 2014, at 1:02 PM, Joscph Thakuria <} G- o

So techmeally, Lesley, I can't do anything until the MGH IRB gives
the go ahead for work to continue. This is not just for Jeffrey. This is
for all they ypo samples. As soon as it's approved, I'll forward an
invoice to yow'Richard/Jeffrey.

[ think realistically, it will be at least 2 weeks before 1 know the
status from the IRB. I may need to recollect ypo samples but I'm
anticipating, Jeffrey's samples, which were collected differently -
under the HMS PGP IRB protocol - can just get moved mto the new
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study.

I'll get back to you 2 weeks from now or earher on where we're at. Apologies for
the delay.

Joe

On Mon, Mar 10, 2014 at 10:32 AM, Lesley Gmﬁ'_ wrote:

Hi Joe.. just checking in to see if you might have some idea of when
the actual invoice will come through for Jeffrey? | know you are
waiting on others.. .but I would like to give Jeffrey some sense of
when this might happen.

Thanks and hope you had a mice weekend.

Lesley
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein
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