
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thur 2/20/2014 2:41:53 PM 
Subject: MC2 

should i press him on payments to CPA taking priority over line of credit pay down or wait until i 
review financials 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeff Fuller 
Subject: RE: 
Date: February 20, 2014 9 39 35 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Hi. 

I am waiting on the year end reporting which I should have any day and will happily 
share all with you and get the balance on the LC. We have been struggling lately with 
payments to CPA, fixed payment plan that you know about, and we are fighting to keep 
current with 2013 (actually close out that 1042 debt) and keep current with this years 
1042. There has been little activity on the LC but I will send you all info. 

Best, 

Jeff 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2014 9:36 AM 
To: Jeff Fuller 
Subject: 

can you please send me that last set of financials you received 
in addition any update on credit line payments? 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 
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tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
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