
To: John P. Woods, AI 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Sat 2/15/2014 11:25:08 AM 
Subject: Re: 

an elevation would be helpful 

On Sat, Feb 15, 2014 at 11:44 AM, John P. Woods, AIA wrote: 

We will make the changes and resend. 

JPW 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 14, 2014, at 5:43 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <teevacation@arnail.com> wrote: 

thanks for the first pass. 1. i gave you a drawing, the window is nothing like the 
kitchen. it is march larger. higher . I need to get from bikes to kitchen. steps 
elevaiton. where do the bikes go. and not be seen from pool . do we raise the 
patio floor. so to be able to walk to the bathroom entrance. 
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