To Ken Holmes[ [ S

Cc: ann rodriquez( | : <hechan |GGG Chis
Sheehan GGG

Bee: jeevacation@gmail . com[jeevacation@gmail.com)

From: Daphne Wallace

Sent: Fri 3/21/2014 3:23:22 PM

Subject: Re: Plant quote

Happy Friday Ken,
Chris really needs to talk with you. Can you give him a call as soon as possible on his new cell,
340-513-9010.

It you cannot reach him, please email or call me so | can track him down for you,

Kind regards, Daphne

On Mon, Mar 3, 2014 at 3:43 PM, Ken Holmes _ wrote:

The credit is actually $1,080 less than noted below, as there are still outstanding consultation
billings for several days on LSJ.

Kenneth Holmes
Cruzan Gardens

000 RR 1

St Croix, USVI 00850

LAY .L'f".lﬂil'l'lg;‘ll'ti';‘fl 5.00m

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 26, 2014, at 12:59 PM, Daphne Wallau_* Wrote:

Happy Wednesday Ken,
Thank you. Anna will print this out and give to Chris, Daphne

On Wed, Feb 26, 2014 at 11:53 AM, Ken Holmes - WTote:

Daphne,

As per Chris Sheehan’s request, please note pricing for the plant materials:

EFTA_R1_00389695
EFTA01935131



(15) Clusia “Autograph’ tree, 6-7" height S 285.00=%4.275.00
(70) Arbicola, 3 gal. § 14.95= 1,046.50

TOTAL $
5,321.50

Let me know if you have questions or require additional information.

Regards,

Kenneth Holmes

Cruzan Gardens

7000 RR 1

Kingshill, USV] 00850
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