
To: Gul'sum Osmanova..
Cc: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacationegmall.com] 
From: bellaklein 
Sent Mon 3/3/2014 7:35:36 PM 
Subject Application Fee 

Dear Gulsum, 
I made a payment of $50 for your application fee. Richard Clark promised a payment 
confirmation with in the next 3 hours. 
Please feel free to contact with any questions. 

Thank you, 
Bella 
On Mar 3, 2014, at 11:00 AM, Gul'sum Osmanova wrote: 

Good. I will wait and check m e-mail constantly. I have a phone number, but I'm 
in Uzbekistan not sure about ease of connection. 

You can call me on google hangouts or skype [username : I though, in case of 
exigency 

Thank you very much. 

On Mon, Mar 3, 2014 at 8:51 PM, bellaklein < wrote: 

Hi Gulsum, 
I called Richard this morning and the office secretary taled that he will come in at 
12:30. I will call him in 2 hours and give you all details. 

Please check you emails. Do you have a phone that i can contact you? 

Thank you. 
Bella 

On Mar 3, 2014, at 10:46 AM, Gul'sum Osmanova <  wrote: 

Hello Ms. Klein, 
Richard Clark asked me about payment yesterday and I told him, that 
you are going to contact him on Monday (which is today) as you 
wrote me. 

Is the whole thing right ? 

avec soin, 
Osmanova. 
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avec sob;, 
GuPsum Osmanova. 
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