To:  Ann Rocriquex( |

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Wed 1/22/2014 3:58:03 PM
Subject: Re: Confirming: Carlos

bonus

On Wed, Jan 22, 2014 at 11:56 AM, Ann Rodriquez {_ wrote:

Hey Bossman,
$2,500.00 (Gift or Bonus)

Please advise,
Ann R.
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