
To: Jeffrey Epstein 'eevacation mail.comj 
Cc: Lesley Gro Bella Kleiri 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Thur 2/13/2014 4:56:11 PM 
Subject Re: Neil Gershenfeld's travel receipts for reimbursement 

please advise if we should pay from: 
I) STC (science related) 
2) JEE personal 
3) Enhanced Education 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
cell-

On Feb 13, 2014, at 11:52 AM, Lesley Groff otc: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Neil Gershenfeld 
Date: February 13, 2014, 11:43:55 AM EST 
To: Lesley Grof 
Subject: Re: deception 

Lesley, 
All set, here are my receipts. 

Neil 

On Wed, Feb 12, 2014 at 6:19 PM, Lesley Groff 

Sounds good 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 12, 2014, at 5:42 PM, Neil Gershenfeld 
wrote: 

Ore: 
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Lesley, 
Last time I had a 9:30 car, which got me there just in 
time, how about if we say 9:15 for buffer. 

cc'ing the others in case they're also flying out. 

Neil 

On Wed, Feb 12, 2014 at 5:09 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Yes I can organize a car to airport ...not a problem. 
What time do you want to arrive JFK? Everyone has a 
different comfort level! 

<Gershenfeld-BOS.pdf,
Cershenfeld-NYP.pdf> 
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