o evc
From: Jeffrey ]

Sent: Thur 1/23/2014 11:01:49 PM
Subject: Re: Spa Tile

great

On Thu, Jan 23, 2014 at 6:56 PM, BMG ||| G

Confirming
Work will begin Monday next week

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jan 22, 2014, at 8:47 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jcevacation( gmail.com™ wrote:

replace

On Wed, Jan 22, 2014 at 11:45 AM, Brice Gordon _ wrote:

Jeftrey
attached estimate and photo's of spa for your reference

the bead blasting of the spa waterline tile failed to remove staining and etching

attached estimate is to remove 6" waterline tile, install new tile and grout entire spa.

material cost: $470.00
labor: $1716.00
travel: $380.00

OH: $454.00

tax: $207.63

total cost: $3227.63

how do you wish to proceed, replace tile or leave existing.?
regards

Brice Gordon

49 Zorro Ranch Rd
Stanley, NM 87056
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside mformation, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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