
To: Larry Visosk 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 12/4/2013 4:34:02 PM 
Subject: Re: Wire to Gulfstream 

ok 

Richard Kahn 

On Wed, Dec 4, 2013 at 11:11 AM, Larry Visoski <Ivjet@aol.com> wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Replaced the UH ACM (Air cycle machine). Prior to replacement, we had 60degree air. Now 

it's producing 42degree air. Good fix. 
May I have your approval for Rich to wire $55,190.00 to Gulfstrcam so I can test fly after lunch 

9 

This payment is to cover ACM cost and install, I still have open work order for avionics and 
maintenance repairs I'm completing. 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 
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