
To: Jeffrey home NTheevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Jean Luc Brunel 
Sent: Sat 12/7/2013 11:01:47 AM 
Subject: RE: FINAL INVOICE 50539 

You will be able to open a store 

Sent from Samsung Mobile 

 Original message 
From: Lilik Sri purwati 
Date: 07/12/2013 5:27 PM (GMT+08:00) 
To: *cevacation mail.com 
Cc: 
Subject: FINAL INVOICE 50539 

Dear Mr. Jee, 
I was spoken with Mr Jean Luc Bruner, please confirm this order. 

Have great day 
Best regard 

LILIK 

PT. LIO COLLECTION 

JI. Raya Kerobokan No. 2 

Br. Taman, Kerobokan - Kuta 

Telp 

Fax 
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