To: Jeffrey Epsteinfjeevacation@agmail com)

From:

Sent: Fri 1/3/2014 11:16:27 PM

Subject: Fwd: 301 East 66th Street Outstanding Proposals
1 August 2013 fee.doc

11B_10B 11J CL-04 revised (2).2ip588 KB webloc

301 revised specs 2.zip703 KB.webloc

11P_8A 11B 10A 11J BED-03 revised.zip797 KB.webloc

On December 1 1th she sent below stating:

'In order to get the revised purchase order for the furniture and for us to move
forward the proposal from PMG that I sent over needs to be signed and the
deposit check will need to be sent, this is only $8,500 and there are terms to this
proposal'

There are also some furniture lists but they are incomplete and without prices. Please let
me know if you would like one of the girls to print out the attachments for you to
make it convenient.

-memme---- Forwarded message ----------
From:

Date: Wed, Dec 11,2013 at 12:41 PM
Subject: Fwd: 301 East 66th Street Outstanding Proposals
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com>

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: [N
Date: December 11, 2013 at 12:33:18 PM AST
I-ﬂ: LU
Subject: FW: 301 East 66th Street Outstanding Proposals
Steve asked me to send this to you as well to review with JE.

Hope you are having a good day.

EFTA_R1_00404703

EFTA01943863



Best

From: NG

To: I
Subject: 301 East 66th Street Outstanding Proposals
Date: Wed, 11 Dec 2013 11:29:45 <0500

Richard,

Hope this email finds you well. 1 am at a complete stand still until the two proposals that
were sent to you and that we discussed on the phone on Nov 5th are signed and
returned to me. I have done 100% of work that can be done on my end until these
get signed and we can start to schedule work and move forward. I have sent
several emails stating just this with no response, please see attached. We are
losing time as it has been a month and there still 1s no progress. In order to get the
revised purchase order for the furniture and for us to move forward the proposal
from PMG that I sent over needs to be signed and the deposit check will need to
be sent, this 1s only $8 500 and there are terms to this proposal. They sent over
the first pass of the furniture on good faith and there are revisions that need to be
made to that package on the PMG side as 1 have provided them with all the
revised specification already. For us to move forward we need to have final
numbers and start ordering ASAP and this requires a signed contract. [ hope that
this 1s clear, if not please let me know as | feel like a broken record. Please let me
know where are with this portion so that we can more forward to meet our time
lines.

Thank you,

EFTA_R1_00404704
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