
To: Jeffrey Epsteinijeevacationggmailcomj 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Mon 11/18/2013 1:04:58 PM 
Subject FW: kids tuition 

The last commission tarry received went against his loan account. 
Currently Larry still has a loan balance (will give you exact amount when I get to office) 
He is asking for money to pay his daughter directly as opposed to loan account or educational 
institution 
Please advise 

From: Larry Visoski 
Date: Sun, 17 Nov 2013 17:24:37 -0500 
To: Richard Kahn...1MM 
Subject: Fwd: kid 

Hi Rich, 
I'd like to have the $10,000 check maybe payable to Brooke Visoski 
1131 Pine Point Road 
Singer Island Fl 33404 

Let's speak Monday 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation ,mail.com> 
Date: November 17 2013 at 11:29:11 AM EST 
To: Lvjet , Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: kids tuition 

your commision is yours. rich pay tuition. asap 

On Sun, Nov 17, 2013 at 5:19 PM, Lvjet ote: 

Jeffery, 
I forgot ask you: 

The first contract we had for the Gil sale you mention a $10,000 commission to 
pay for Brooke current Collage tuition that was due in October, since I was able to 
get Gary to pay the additional $10,000 brokers fee out of Gary's $40k commish. of course that 
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deal didn't close, but I feel my personality and knowledge helped with the sale and 
showing of the Gil last week in Islip. I displayed all the current log books a table, the 
Buyers Pilot took a photo and sent to buyer, and told him out Gil maintenance is 
impeccable and was impressed with my log history and Mx items. 

Since that deal didn't close and Gary produced another buyer, should I assume I didn't earn this 
commission to pay for her school, 

I already paid $8,965.83 last month and I expect to receive another invoice in January for the 
same amount for her second term. I just want to get closure on this topic. 

thank you 
Larry 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to ject acation67 email.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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