To:
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Mon 11/25/2013 10:27:44 AM

Subject: Re:

ok

On Sun, Nov 24, 2013 at 4:31 PM, ||| G- - -

Jeffrey,

There was a charity that I worked with but they accepted some
donations on my behalf because I founded and ran Youth Bridge Club in
NYC. 1 don't know if they will be willing to accept the money for
developing web based project.

I'm going to national bridge tournament next week and I will talk to
few people and see if I can find a charity. How much money are you
interested to contribute?

Thanks,

On Sun, Nov 24, 2013 at 4:41 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail. com> wrote:
= is htere a charity that 1 may contribute to that would at least begin your

> project?

-

-
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= The imformation contamned in this communication 1s

> confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

= constitute inside information, and is intended only for

> the use of the addressee. It is the property of

> Jeftrey Epstein

= Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

> communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

> and may be unlawful. If you have received this

= communication in error, please notify us immediately by
> return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
> destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

= including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EE RS P e R R R P e P E ]

The information contained in this communication is

EFTA_R1_00410096
EFTA01947097



confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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