To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent; Tue 11/26/2013 7:11:11 PM

Subject: Fwd: 9 East 71st Street Insurance claim

attached is analysis of insurance claim

1 still need to submit wall covering estimate for the yoga room

is there a specific vendor you would like me to reach out to? tara?
rich barnett believes this 1s a Pinto installation

please advise

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel
fax

cel

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn < GINGGGEE

Subject: 9 East 71st Street Insurance claim
Date: November 26, 2013 2:00:45 PM EST
To: "Sontag, Matthew A" <

thank you

i will be in touch next week regarding final piece to this loss which is wall covering

please advise on address check will be sent to

happy holidays

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel

fax

cel

WIrote:

Richard,

The check has been issued. lust a FYl. Also, here is the current

breakdown.

EFTA_R1_00412542
EFTA01948289



Please forward wallpaper bid when you can. Thanks and have a great
holiday.

$2,736.00

$23,731.20

Matthew Sontag
AIG Personal Lines
General Adjuster

100 Co i ite 2100, Berkeley Heights, NJ 07922
Phone: | Fax: [

| www.aig.com
IMPORTAMT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If vou have received this emall in error, please mmediataly

netify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the ernginal and any coples or printouls
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responstbility of the reciplent to ensure that it ks virus free and no responsibility & accepted by
Chartis for any boss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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