
To: Richard Kahnl l 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 11/6/20134:48:06 PM 
Subject Re: N212JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INV13-01538 

ok 

On Wed, Nov 6, 2013 at 10:34 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Larry says you approved talk and text already and repairs were must fix items 
Please advise if ok to pay attached invoice for GIV of 26,179.15 

From: Larry Visoski "MM. 
Subject: Re: N212JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INV13-01538 
Date: November 6, 2013 10:31:16 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

JE approved the talk n text already the repair on converter was a must fix item 

Sent from my iPad 

On Nov 6, 2013, at 10:22 AM, Richard Kahn 

did you present or mention to jee for approval? 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

wrote: 

From: Larry Visoski  
Subject: Fwd: N212JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INV13-01538 
Date: Novembe 
To: Rich Kahn Bella Klein 
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Jege LLC approved 
Can we send wire tomorrow ? 
Thx 
Landed teterboro 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "E. Julian Murray" 
Date: November 5, 2013 at 3:50:58 PM 
To: ' 
Subject: FW: N2I2JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INVI3-01538 

Larry.

Attached is the invoice and the wiring instructions. 

Thank you for allowing us to service your aircraft. 

E. Julian Murray 

Manager of Maintenance Operations 

Hawthorne Global Aviation Services 

2221 Smithtown Ave. 

Ronkonkoma, NY 11779 

office 

cell 

From: Patricia Mazza 
Sent: Tuesday, November 05, 2013 10:34 AM 
To: E. Julian Murray 
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Subject: FW: N212JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INV13-01538 

From: Patricia Mazza 
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2013 11:09 AM 
To: 'Larry Visoski 
Cc: E. Julian Murray 
Subject: N212JE Maintenance Work Order 23477 INV13-01538 

Larry. 

Please look over attached Invoice for maintenance work that was performed 
on aircraft N2I2JE. 

If you have any questions contact me at anytime. 

Thank you, 

Pat 

*** Hawthorne Global Aviation wire payment instructions attached 

Patricia Mazza 
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Administrative Assistant 

Long Island MacArthur Airport 

2221 Smithtown Avenue 

Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

Phone: 

Fax: 

*************** ***** ****** * ********* * ******** ************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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