To: Boris Nikolic/

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Mon 11/4/2013 12:51:20 AM

Subject: Re: after we talked

yes, and he thought he would pay 2- million , and not have to deal with it in the future, He cries
because he knows it is wrong, not because he is sad .

On Sun, Nov 3, 2013 at 5:11 PM, Boris Nikolic _13 wrote:

[ kept thinking.

I do think that coincidence are sometimes happening but they are super rare (as a chance for
their occurrence is super small) and it should be viewed as such (not believe in them).

[ just went through my emails and dates.
He replied NO re NYC house on May 12th

He usually works on a month or a quarter time frame (e.g. He usually decided to act on
something and he does within a month or 3 months - like a clock).

We met 1:1 on May 19 when he told me that other people like Larry are asking for a rise and
that a same might happened with BGI group.

May 22nd - Mila happened.

June 9th - [ met him in Paris (with you as well) and he told me that something is happening
(he knew at that time).

June 12th - a month after NO email, he sent me an email re Melinda finding out and s not being
able to work together.

I think that he used Mila event to engineer the story.
That Mila did not happened, it would be some other thing and perhaps later - on August 12th.

It might be all coincidence - but when chance is so small I have hard time believing
I hope you are not finding me paranoid!
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