
To: Lvjet[ 
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent Tue 11/19/2013 6:36:34 PM 
Subject: Re: GIV stereo 

yes for equipment. only 

On Tue, Nov 19, 2013 at 7:28 PM, Lvjet c wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Eric wants to confirm that you are willing to pay for new equipment for stereo install 
and he will attempt to have Kevin issue a credit for equipement he provided? 
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