
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 11/20/2013 12:45:25 PM 
Subject: Re: Mark Tollison 

yee 

On Wed, Nov 20, 2013 at 1:44 PM, Richard Kahn <M=E- wrote: 

Please advise if ok to pay 10,000 by HBRK for his second month 
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