
To: Ann Rodriquez 
From: Jeffrey Epstei 
Sent Fri 11/1/2013 4:58:10 PM 
Subject: Re: Coral Stone tiles 

12th 

On Fri, Nov 1, 2013 at 12:57 PM, Ann Rodriquez ote: 

1-ley Bossman, 
Cost of 4 Pallets of tiles $3,172.96. 

Plow fast would you like your tiles to arrive... 

Shipping cost: 
$3,005.00 arrive on Nov 12th Tue. 
$1,700.00 arrive on Nov 27th Wed. 

Ann R. 

 Forwarded Mcssauc 
From: Daphne Wallace 
To: Ann Rodriquez 

Rich Kahn 
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2013 2:58 PM 
Subject: Re: Coral Stone tiles 

Mark Tollison 

Greetings Anna, 
Luis is revising the invoice to reflect the 4 pallets, delivered to the port of DR. 

Next decision - shipping: 

Option A - Luis has room in a container he is shipping from DR on 11/8. Leaves DR on 
11/8, in FL on 11/15, delivered to Tropical FL 11/19, sail on 11/22, on STT 
11/26, on LSJ 11/27. 

Shipping from DR to FL - $1,200 and Tropical FL to STT - $500 

Option B - Tropical DR to STT - leaves on Wednesday, arrives on Saturday, clear and 
pick up on Monday - 20' dry container - 53,005.00. 

Besides the difference in price, there is the delivery time - if JE wants this complete by 
Thanksgiving, Option B is the better option. 

Please advise, DW 
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On Thu, Oct 31, 2013 at 1:57 PM, Ann Rodriquez
-

Hey Daph, 

JE is requesting 4 pallets (200 each) of Coral Stone tiles to be ordered. 

Ann R. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

wrote: 
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