
To: Daphne Wallace 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 11/4/2013 7:22:38 PM 
Subject: Re: Dome Project - November 4.2013 

Yes 

On Monday, November 4, 2013, Daphne Wallace wrote: 

Greetings Mr. Epstein, 
Samson Welding has agreed to accept $20,000 for the entire project - fabrication and paint 
job. Is it okay to release a 50% deposit of $10,000 for him to begin? 

Respectfully, 

Daphne 
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