
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Tue 10/15/2013 7:36:34 PM 

I finally connected with Nadia today and when i discussed Aviloop paying 16,000 of pilot 
expenses she sounded surprised and had no understanding of why. 
She said she was going to reach out to you in next day or so as tomorrow am she was traveling to 
California. 

Richard Kahn 

Begin torwarded message: 

From: Nadia 
Subject: Re: 
Date: October 10, 2013 6:58:11 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Rich, I am flying a plane to Dallas tomorrow and not sure what time I would be able to 
call. Does Monday work for you? 

Nadia 

Sent from my iPad 

On Oct 10, 2013, at 5:07 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

can we talk tomorrow regarding aviloop paying aviation expenses 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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