To: Larry ‘v’isoski[-
From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Thur 11/7/2013 3:16:08 PM
Subject: Re: Gll deal

Yes
On Thursday, November 7, 2013, Larry Visoski wrote:

Jeftrey

Sell is prepared to close today or tomorrow at latest. Seller is asking for us to pay the expense

for reposition fuel to closing in Wilmington.
Fuel cost is $5300 for the hour flight from islip to Wilmington,
Do you approve paying this expense in order to close?

Pls advise

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone
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